‘ METROPOLITAN LIBRARY COMMISSION
OF OKLAHOMA COUNTY

Thursday, April 19, 2012, 3:30 p.m.
Downtown Library
300 Park Avenue
Oklahoma City, OK 73102
(Telephone: 231-8650)

The Metropolitan Library System of Oklahoma County encourages participation from all patrons and citizens of Oklahoma County. If participation
at any public meeting is not possible due to a disability, whether physical, hearing or speech related, please notify the office of the Executive
Director (606-3726) at least forty-eight (48) hours prior to the scheduled public meeting to allow the Library to make necessary accommodations.

3:30 pm CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL TO ESTABLISH QUORUM
Fran Cory, Chair
3:30 - 3:45 pm INTRODUCTIONS

— Document #90 — Presentation of Service Certificates for Library Staff

COMMENTS FROM GENERAL PUBLIC (Limited to 3 minutes per speaker or 15 minutes total with time pro-rated among speakers. Preference
will be given to residents of Oklahoma County. Persons signing up to address the Commission must list their residential address and indicate if
they request to speak to a specific agenda item or to another Library Commission related topic or issue.) Please be advised that public seating is
limited; seating capacity at the individual meeting sites vary in occupancy limits.

3:45 - 4:00 pm CONSENT DOCKET (#91 - #93)

— Document #91 - Approval of Minutes of March 15, 2012 Meeting
— Document #92 — Acceptance of Review of Expenditures for March 2012

— Document #93 — Contract Awards and Purchases

Item A: Furniture for Southern Oaks Library

Item B: Furniture for Southern Oaks Library

Item C: Furniture for Southern Oaks Library

Item D: Furniture for Southern Oaks Library

Item E: Furniture for Southern Oaks Library

Item F: Netbooks

Item G: HVAC Systems for the Bethany, Harrah, and Village Libraries

4:00 - 4:15 pm REPORT AND RECOMMENDATIONS FROM ADMINISTRATION

— Document #94 — Discussion, Consideration, and Possible Action — Commission Elected
Candidates to the Library Endowment Trust Board

4:15 - 4:45 pm INFORMATION REPORTS

— Document #95 — MLS March 2012 Library Visits
— Document #96 — MLS March 2012 Circulation Report

Document #97 — MLS March 2012 Computer Usage Report
Document #98 — MLS March 2012 System Reserve Report

4:45 - 4:50 pm EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR’S REPORT

4:50 - 5:00 pm COMMENTS FROM COMMISSION MEMBERS

NEXT COMMISSION MEETING DATE AND PLACE:
May 17, 2012
Village Library, 10307 N. Penn, The Village, OK 73120
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PRESENTATION OF SERVICE CERTIFICATES TO LIBRARY STAFF

The Friends of the Metropolitan Library System have underwritten a staff recognition service
program recognizing staff who have been employed by the Library System for five years or
more. The Friends provide an attractive pin with the library system logo and name for staff
who have served five years. After 10 years, a ruby is added to the pin; subsequent rubies are
added at 10, 15, 20 and 25-year intervals of service culminating with the addition of a
diamond to the pin for 30 years of service. The Library System staff are presented with the
pins at a special reception hosted by the Friends each year.

To complement that recognition of service in a formal way, the Metropolitan Library
Commission of Oklahoma County presents service certificates of appreciation to Library
System staff for these same increments of service. The staff to be presented with certificates
will be recognized at each monthly meeting at which time the certificates are presented.

Library System staff receiving Certificates of Service in April 2012:

Employees Years of Service
Clyde D. Herrod, Associate Cataloger, Cataloging 30
Jean M. Wilburn, Circulation Clerk, Belle Isle Library 20
Keri L. Cloud, Library Aide, Edmond Library 10

Jeanette C. Mirll, Library Aide, Edmond Library
Kevin R. Sendall, Circulation Clerk, Choctaw Library

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Administration Office
MLS - Service Certificates April 2012 Page 1 of 1
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MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MONTHLY MEETING
OF THE METROPOLITAN LIBRARY COMMISSION
OF OKLAHOMA COUNTY

DATE: March 15, 2012

TIME: 3:30 pm

MEETING PLACE: Midwest City Library

Written public notice of the time, date, and place of this meeting was given to the County Clerk
of Oklahoma County November 3, 2011. Notice of the time, date, place, and agenda for this
meeting was posted by the Secretary of the Commission in prominent public view at the Midwest
City Library and the Downtown Library, 300 Park Avenue, Oklahoma City, on March 13, 2012, in
conformity with the Oklahoma Open Meeting Act §311.

Commission Members
PRESENT:

Nancy Anthony, Disbursing Agent

Ralph Bullard
Cynthia Friedemann
Rozz Grigsby
Deanna Hannah
Jose Jimenez
Carolyn Leslie
Penny McCaleb
Tracy McDaniel
Tracy McGehee
Mekush Patel

Kim Patterson

Jim Shonts

Judy Smith, Vice-Chair
Alyne Strube

Beth Toland

Susan Tucker

Ray Vaughn

Greg Womack

Fran Cory, Chair
Jim Welch, Deputy Executive
Director/Technology
(Secretary)

EXCUSED:

Bose’ Akadiri

Mick Cornett, Mayor of Oklahoma City
Helene Harpman

Lori Nelson

Brenda Palmer

Hugh Rice

Vanna Shaw

Estimate of general public and staff attending: 14

MLC - April 19, 2012

MLS - Minutes of March 15, 2012 MLC Meeting

Prepared by: MLC Secretary
Page 1 of 3
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I. The meeting was called to order at 3:31 p.m. by Mrs. Fran Cory, Chair. Mrs. Cory
introduced Mrs. Tracy Thompson, Assistant Manager of the Midwest City Library. Mrs.
Thompson welcomed the commission and provided them with information on the current
events at Midwest City.

II. Roll was called to establish a quorum. Present: Friedemann, Grigsby, Hannah,
Jimenez, Leslie, McCaleb, McDaniel, McGehee, Patel, Patterson, Shonts, Smith, Toland,
Tucker, Vaughn, Cory (Bullard, 3:34; Anthony, 3:40; Womack, 3:40; Strube, 3:59).

III. Mrs. Cory introduced Mr. Jim Welch, Deputy Executive Director/Information
Technology who is filling in for Mrs. Donna Morris, Executive Director (Secretary).

IV.  Mrs. Cory called for the Presentation of Service certificates for March 2012: Jill
Vessels, Cataloging Technician, Cataloging-25 years of service; Denise Ryan, Accounting
Technician, Business Office-5 years of service.

Although they were unable to attend the meeting, Mrs. Cory recognized the following
employees for their years of service: Denise Courts, Benefits Specialist, Human Resources-
25 years of service; Joe Poe, Security, Downtown-25 years of service; Beverly Cunningham,
Librarian, Southern Oaks-5 years of service; Jeffrey Fredericks, Circulation Clerk, Edmond-
S years of service; Rebecca Mason, Circulation Clerk, Warr Acres-5 years of service.

V. Mrs. Cory called for comments from the general public. There were none.

VI. Mrs. Cory presented the Consent Docket: Document #82 — Approval of Minutes of
February 16, 2012 Meeting; Document #83 — Acceptance of Review of Expenditures for
February 2012; Document #84 — Contract Awards & Purchases February 2012.

Mrs. Cory called for a motion.

Mrs. Beth Toland moved to accept the consent docket. Mrs. Penny
McCaleb seconded. Questions and discussion followed. Motion passed
unanimously.

VII. Mrs. Cory referred to Document #85 — Discussion, Consideration, and Possible
Action -Long-Range Planning Committee meeting minutes, February 27, 2012 - Penny
McCaleb, Chair.

Mrs. Penny McCaleb referred to the minutes and reported on the topics discussed at the
Long-Range Planning Committee meeting. She highlighted the Guidelines for Locating and
Planning Library Facilities, and the recent changes made to the guidelines. Mrs. McCaleb
also reported on the current capital projects that are underway. Questions and Discussion
followed. No action is needed from the Long-Range Planning Committee meeting.

VIII. Mrs. Cory referred to Special Presentations — Literary Voices

Mrs. Diane Sarantakos, Director of Development and Volunteer reported the annual
Literary Voices event will be held at the Oklahoma City Golf and Country Club on Tuesday,
April 10. This year’s event will feature author, Mary Higgins Clark. Commission member,
Mr. Hugh Rice, will be recognized as the Lee Brawner award recipient at the event.

IX. Mrs. Cory called on Mr. Welch to present the Information Reports.
@ Document #86 — MLS February 2012 Library Visits

@ Document #87 — MLS February 2012 Circulation Report
@ Document #88 — MLS February 2012 Computer Usage Report
@ Document #89 — MLS February 2012 System Reserve Report
MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: MLC Secretary
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Questions and discussion followed.
X. Mrs. Cory called on Mr. Welch to present the Executive Director’s Report.

Mr. Welch called on Mr. Lloyd Lovely to introduce the new Director of Human Resources,
Ms. Lori Hedin.

The annual Oklahoma Library Association conference will be held at the Embassy Suites in
Norman on March 28 to March 30. If any commissioners are interested in attending, please
contact the Director’s office.

Mr. Welch reported on recent minor changes made to the Purchasing policy (SF200). The
changes have been temporarily implemented, and the Finance committee will be reviewing
them in May.

Mr. Welch reminded the Commission of upcoming meeting location changes. The April 19th
Commission meeting will be held at the Downtown Library and the June 21st Commission
meeting will be held at the Northwest Library.

The Friends Annual Booksale raised over $230,000.00 in the three day sale at the
Fairgrounds.

Mr. Welch reported on discussions that are currently underway regarding the possibility of
keeping the Almonte location open once the Southern Oaks Walker location re-opens. The
Almonte location is currently serving a fairly significant number of new customers who did
not use the Southern Oaks location. Administration has met with city councilman and
former commission member, David Greenwell regarding the possibility. Mr. Greenwell has
heard from a number of citizens in his ward who would like to see the Almonte location
remain open. The property management firm is interested in discussing this with us and
we will be approaching the City to share some of the potential lease costs.

XI. The next Commission meeting will be held at the Downtown Library on April 19,
2012,

There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at 4:00 pm.

Vur [ el

1m Welch, Deputy Executive
Ditector /Technology
(Secretary)

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: MLC Secretary
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CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES

The following recommendations for the Commission’s approval are made in accordance
with the Library System’s purchasing policy. For additional information regarding these
recommendations, please contact the Purchasing Officer at 606-3794.

ITEM A: FURNITURE FOR SOUTHERN OAKS LIBRARY

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is funding for new furniture for the renovated
Southern Oaks Library. The architects Meyer, Scherer, & Rockcastle (MS&R) and the
Library selected the furniture to be purchased and MS&R prepared the specifications for
the furniture. BCI Library Design is one of the manufacturers recommended by MS&R.

Cultural Surroundings is the only designated dealer for Oklahoma and is considered the
sole source for this purchase.

Model | Unit Extended
Code | Style No. Price Qty | Price
036 Mezitta Computer Station | Mez $2,288.00 | 34 | $77,792.00

Freight & Install | 1 $7,905.28

Total $85,697.28

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission award the contract for the Mezitta to Cultural Surroundings in the
amount of $85,697.28. Adequate funding is available in the FY 2011-2012 budget, account
450.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Finance Office
MLS - Contract Awards and Purchases April 2012 Page 1 of 8
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CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES
(cont’d)
ITEM B: FURNITURE FOR SOUTHERN OAKS LIBRARY

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is funding for new furniture for the renovated
Southern Oaks Library. The architects Meyer, Scherer, & Rockcastle (MS&R) and the
Library selected the furniture to be purchased and MS&R prepared the specifications for
the furniture. Haworth, Inc. is one of the manufacturers recommended by MS&R.

Haworth, Inc. was awarded a competitively bid contract with U.S. Communities on May 1,
2007. The contract has been renewed each year thereafter.

Vater Office Furniture is the local Haworth dealer. The pricing below is the U.S.
Communities contract pricing.

Unit Extended
Code | Style Model No. Price Qty | Price
005 | Very Side Chair SCS-24-01 $244.80 22 $5,385.60
006 | Very Wire Stackers SCH-44-0S $88.80 | 110 $9,768.00
019 | Zody Task Chair SZT-20-721MA1 | $572.64 14 $8,016.96
020 | Zody Task Stool SPLL-8529 $732.96 2 $1,465.92
TARA-3060-L

035 | Planew Y-Leg Flip Top Table | JSNYH4 $497.08 4 $1,988.32
119 | Very Stacking Cart SCT-1 $189.12 5 $945.60

Total $27,570.40

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission award the contract for the Haworth furniture to Vater Office
Furniture in the amount of $27,570.40. Adequate funding is available in the FY 2011-2012

budget, account 450.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Finance Office
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CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES

(cont’d)
ITEM C: FURNITURE FOR SOUTHERN OAKS LIBRARY

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is funding for new furniture for the renovated
Southern Oaks Library. The architects Meyer, Scherer, & Rockcastle (MS&R) and the
Library selected the furniture to be purchased and MS&R prepared the specifications for
the furniture. Knoll, Inc. is one of the manufacturers recommended by MS&R.

Knoll, Inc. was awarded a competitively bid contract with U.S. Communities on May 1,
2007. The contract has been renewed each year thereafter.

Spaces, Inc. is the local Knoll dealer. The pricing below is the U.S. Communities contract
pricing.

Unit Extended
Code Style Price Qty Price
Knoll Upstart Table w/
043 | Storage Below $838.26 | 1 $838.26
Knoll Dividends Horizon
110 | Private Office $4,044.18 | 1 $4,044.18

Knoll Dividends Horizon
111 | Row of 2 Workstations $3,239.94 | 1 $3,239.94
Knoll Dividends Horizon
112 | Row of 3 Workstations $5,553.56 | 1 $5,553.56
Knoll Dividends Horizon
Cluster of 3

113 | Workstations $4,499.60 | 1 $4,499.60
Knoll Dividends Horizon
114 | Single Desk w/Overhead | $1,996.41 | 1 $4,114.50

Total $22,290.04

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission award the contract for the Knoll furniture to Spaces, Inc. in the
amount of $22,290.04. Adequate funding is available in the FY 2011-2012 budget, account
450

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Finance Office
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CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES
(cont’d)
ITEM D: FURNITURE FOR SOUTHERN OAKS LIBRARY

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is funding for new furniture for the renovated
Southern Oaks Library. The architects Meyer, Scherer, & Rockcastle (MS&R) and the
Library selected the furniture to be purchased and MS&R prepared the specifications for
the furniture. Steelcase, Inc. is one of the manufacturers recommended by MS&R.

Steelcase, Inc. was awarded a competitively bid contract with National Joint Powers
Alliance (NJPA) on July 22,2010. The contract has been renewed each year thereafter.

Scott Rice, Inc. is the local Steelcase dealer. The pricing below is the NJPA contract
pricing.

Unit Extended

Code | Style Model No. Price Qty | Price
008A | Coalesse Alina Chair 321 $1,480.03 | 10 | $14,800.30
008B | Coalesse Alina Chair 321 $1,115.83 | 4 $4,463.32
008C | Coalesse Alina Chair 321 $1,415.66 | 4 $5,662.64
008D | Coalesse Alina Chair 321 $1,106.87 | 4 $4,427.48
Delivery Charge | 1 $483.46
Total $29,837.20

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission award the contract for the Steelcase furniture to Scott Rice, Inc. in
the amount of $29,837.20. Adequate funding is available in the FY 2011-2012 budget,
account 4350.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Finance Office
MLS - Contract Awards and Purchases April 2012 Page 4 of 8



Document #93
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES
(cont’d)
ITEM E: FURNITURE FOR SOUTHERN OAKS LIBRARY

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is funding for new furniture for the renovated
Southern Oaks Library. The architects Meyer, Scherer, & Rockcastle (MS&R) and the
Library selected the furniture to be purchased and MS&R prepared the furniture
specifications for the bid.

Bids were let for 28 days and were advertised for two days in The Oklahoman (March 13
and 20, 2012). Bid packets were sent to 23 prospective bidders and two Plan Rooms.

A pre-bid conference was held on Wednesday, March 20, 2012. Three vendors attended.
Bids were received and publicly opened on April 10, 2012. Ten vendors responded.

See attached bid tabulation.

Scott Rice is the best and lowest bidder for Furniture Groups B, J, and M.

Spaces is the best and lowest bidder for Furniture Groups D, E, and K.

Bill Warren is the best and lowest bidder for Furniture Groups A, C, F, H, and I.
Copelins is the best and lowest bidder for Furniture Groups G and P.

KI is the best and lowest bidder for Furniture Group O.

Cultural Surroundings is the best and lowest bidder for Furniture Groups L, N, and Q.

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission award the contracts for the furniture for the new Northwest Library
to the following vendors: Scott Rice for furniture groups B, J, and M in the amount of
$6,315.05; Spaces for furniture groups D, E, and K in the amount of $23,191.00; Bill
Warren for furniture groups A, C, F, H, and I in the amount of $37,337.65; Copelins for
furniture groups G and P in the amount of $24,447.89: KI for furniture group O in the
amount of $861.00 and Cultural Surrounding for furniture groups L, N, and Q in the
amount of $169,816.00. Adequate funding is available in the FY 2011-2012 budget,
account 408.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Finance Office
MLS - Contract Awards and Purchases April 2012 Page 5 of 8
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Vance Hunt Library Interiors Cultural
Furniture Group Scott Rice Spaces Bill Warren Copelins Kl & Associates | LDS Group of Texas Surroundings | Burroughs
Group A: Emeco $16,036.60 $16,184.00 | $15,748.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group B: ICF $1,941.66 $1,952.00 $1,947.28 $1,975.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group C: Teknion No Bid No Bid $11,407.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group D: Vitra $6,156.56 $5,292.00 $6,152.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group E: Azure $20,070.39 $16,311.00 | $20,652.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group F: HBF $5,670.00 $5,700.00 $5,232.40 $5,705.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group G: Keilhauer $16,325.04 $16,483.00 | $16,526.11 $16,120.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group H: Bernhardt
Design $2,870.16 $2,766.00 $2,479.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group I: Botanist No Bid No Bid $2,469.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group J: Campbell
Contract $3,052.40 $3,308.00 $3,222.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group K: CAB Deco $1,883.34 $1,588.00 $1,738.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group L: Worden or
Approved Equal No Bid No Bid $23,190.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,230.00 $19,240.00 No Bid
Group M:
Sparkeology $1,320.99 $2,839.00 $1,325.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group N: TMC or
Approved Equal $3,730.66 $3,688.00 $3,666.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,108.00 No Bid
Group O: Harter or
Approved Equal $1,098.22 $1,072.00 $1,111.44 $1,086.00 $861.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group P: Southern
Aluminum $8,885.48 $9,228.00 $9,533.68 $8,354.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group Q: MJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $151,602.00 | $164,919.00 No Bid $147,468.00 | $160,855.81
Total Award $6,315.05 $23,191.00 | $37,337.65 | $24,474.89 | $861.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $169,816.00 $0.00
Grand Total $261,995.59

The following vendors did not bid:

Brodart, Business Iteriors by Staples, Interiors for Business, Libra Tech Corp., Office Concepts, OCI, Southwestern Stationers
Office USA, South West Solutions, Stows Office Furniture, Vater, Village Furniture, and Workplace Resource.

MLC - April 19, 2012
MLS - Contract Awards and Purchases April 2012

Prepared by: Finance Office
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CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES
(cont’d)
ITEM F: NETBOOKS

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is the request for netbooks. These computers are
similar to a laptop but smaller and more portable. These netbooks will allow library staff
to issue library cards to customers in various locations both in the library and off-site using
wireless Internet access. They can issue cards to students on a school visit in the meeting
room or go to the school and issue cards in the classroom. They can also take the
computers to off-site events where wireless Internet access is available and issue cards to
interested customers.

The Library’s purchasing policy allows the Library to purchase off of any state contract.
The State of Oklahoma still participates in the Western States Contracting Alliance for
computers under State Contract #SW206.

Hewlett-Packard participates in the State Contract pricing. They have a 3115m Notebook
PC that meets the requirements of the library. The price of these units is $494 each and
includes a 3-year warranty.

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission approve the purchase of 26 netbook computers to Hewlett-Packard in
the amount of $12,844. Funding for the purchase is provided for in the FY2011-12 budget,
account 410.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Finance Office
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CONTRACT AWARDS AND PURCHASES
(cont’d)
ITEM G: HVAC SYSTEMS FOR THE BETHANY, HARRAH, AND VILLAGE LIBRARIES

Provided for in the FY2011-12 budget is funding for replacement of the HVAC systems at
the Bethany, Harrah, and Village Libraries. Specifications were prepared and bids were let
for 21 days. The bid was advertised for two days (March 20 and 27) in The Oklahoman.

Bids were sent to seven prospective bidders and to four plan rooms. A pre-bid meeting was
held on March 29. Seven vendors attended.

Bids were received and publicly opened on April 10, 2011.

Hardesty United Metro Metropolitan Air DePaul's
Library Team Mechanical | Service Co | Comfort OK | AC Service Engineering Installs
Bethany | $91,450.00 No Bid $85,584.00 No Bid $194,500.00 No Bid No Bid
Village $67,500.00 No Bid $77,600.00 No Bid $65,765.00 No Bid No Bid
Harrah $7,400.00 No Bid $7,890.00 No Bid $8,020.00 No Bid No Bid
Total $166,350.00 No Bid $171,074.00 No Bid $268,285.00 No Bid No Bid
RECOMMENDATION:

That the Commission award the contract for the purchase and installation of the HVAC
systems to Hardesty Team in the amount of $166,350. Adequate funding is available in the
FY 2011-2012 budget, account 450.

MLC - April 19, 2012
MLS - Contract Awards and Purchases April 2012

Prepared by: Finance Office
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REPORT AND RECOMMENDATIONS FROM ADMINISTRATION

Commission Elected Candidates to the Library Endowment Trust Board

Recently, the Library Endowment Trust changed their bylaws to make it easier
to facilitate contributions from donors. This requires that the Metropolitan
Library Commission appoint a majority of the Trustees. These trustees are
referred to as “Class A Trustees.” The Bylaws also state that the Trust Board
Governance Committee prepares two (2) slates of candidates for Trustees.

The first slate shall consist of Class A candidates and shall be presented to the
Library Commission for appointment. Such slate shall be presented to the
Commission prior to the last meeting of the fiscal year of the Trust to allow the
appointed Commission elected Trustees to be announced at the last meeting of
the fiscal year of the Trust.

For your consideration, the Library Endowment Trust Board Governance
Committee presents the following candidate for new Trustee:

Craig Woodruff

Treasurer - - North America
Archer Well Company, Inc.
14201 Caliber Drive, Suite 300
Oklahoma City, Ok 73134

COMMMISSION ACTION:

That the Commission approve the appointment of Craig Woodruff to the Library
Endowment Trust.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Director’s Office
MLS - Report and Recommendations from Administration - Page 1 of 1
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MLS Library Visits

July 1, 2011 - March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

March FY 11 FY 12 Pct. Change
Library Month Year Month Year Month Year
Belle Isle 23,251 197,564 20,459 188,212 -12.0% -4.7%
Bethany 13,796 121,516 13,482 122,930 -2.3% 1.2%
Capitol Hill 11,030 88,583 10,625 95,661 -3.7% 8.0%
Choctaw 8,388 66,940 7,228 64,602 -13.8% -3.5%
Del City 9,404 87,519 9,297 87,902 -1.1% 0.4%
Downtown 32,439 286,165 26,417 248,381 -18.6% -13.2%
Edmond 33,523 278,744 30,052 270,702 -10.4% -2.9%
Midwest City 22,792 192,248 22,089 198,316 -3.1% 3.2%
Ralph Ellison 13,618 122,404 14,272 134,586 4.8% 10.0%
Southern Oaks temp 21,777 183,629 18,950 177,246 -13.0% -3.5%
Village 19,130 158,094 18,117 158,930 -5.3% 0.5%
Warr Acres 17,348 153,915 16,932 154,162 -2.4% 0.2%
Harrah 2,830 23,627 2,368 20,767 -16.3% -12.1%
Jones 501 4,033 362 3,885 -27.8% -3.7%
Luther 2,126 19,642 1,993 18,527 -6.3% -8.7%
Nicoma Park 1,126 9,588 1,397 9,803 24.1% 2.2%
Wright 1,441 13,846 1,427 13,562 -1.0% -2.0%
Total 234,520 2,008,055 215,467 1,968,175 -8.1% -2.0%
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Circulation Gains and Losses

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)
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Document # 96
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

Circulation Gains and Losses

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

ADULT

MARCH 31, 2012 MONTH
Belle Isle 11 44468
12 38648

-5820

Bethany 11 25624
12 22720

-2904

Capitol Hill 11 7726
12 7680

-46

Choctaw 11 12701
12 11249

-1452

Del City 11 12171
12 11915

-256

Downtown 11 18006
12 15701

-2305

Edmond 11 64339
12 57771

-6568

Midwest City 11 32481
12 30829

-1652

Ralph Ellison 11 8269
12 9202

933

Southern Oaks 11 34012
12 27912

-6100

Village 11 31776
12 29050

-2726

Warr Acres 11 32257
12 31236

-1021

MLC - April 19, 2012

ADULT JUVENILE JUVENILE TOTAL TOTAL

YEAR MONTH
399180 13208
353004 12343
-46176 -865
226047 10450
215629 11014
-10418 564

61942 4548

66377 4535

4435 -13
104630 7633
108530 7666

3900 33
111258 4928
113660 5163

2402 235
160358 5388
149882 5325
-10476 -63
574799 44849
531875 43656
-42924 -1193
293379 11398
279345 13833
-14034 2435

70854 1869

81583 2657

10729 788
311176 13321
264936 12077
-46240 -1244
278801 13724
272306 13452

-6495 -272
268867 11884
274556 12635

5689 751

MLS - March 2012 Circulation Gains & Losses

YEAR MONTH YEAR %

118507 57676 517687
115161 50991 468165
-3346 -6685 -49522 -9.6

95579 36074 321626
98354 33734 313983
2775 -2340 -7643 -2.4

32096 12274 94038
40103 12215 106480
8007 -59 12442 13.2

60133 20334 164763
68579 18915 177109
8446 -1419 12346 7.5

47083 17099 158341
44853 17078 158513
-2230 -21 172 1

48623 23394 208981
48085 21026 197967
-538 -2368 -11014 -5.3

396341 109188 971140
406772 101427 938647
10431 -7761 -32493 -3.3

108183 43879 401562
118252 44662 397597
10069 783 -3965 -1.0

22127 10138 92981
27338 11859 108921
5211 1721 15940 17.1

110604 47333 421780
109132 39989 374068
-1472 -7344 -47712 -11.3

121653 45500 400454
124929 42502 397235
3276 -2998 -3219 -.8

107778 44141 376645
113801 43871 388357
6023 -270 11712 3.1
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Circulation Gains and Losses

Document # 96
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

ADULT
MARCH 31, 2012 MONTH

EXTENSION LIBRARIES:
Harrah 11 3764
12 3404
-360
Jones 11 913
12 533
-380
Luther 11 2321
12 2861
540
Nicoma Park 11 2036
12 1748
-288
Wright 11 887
12 711
-176

OTHER:

Book Centers 11 10242
12 10526
284
Books-by-Mail 11 2104
12 2204
100
eMedia - Audio 11 7465
12 8601
1136
eMedia - eBooks 11 9067
12 27175
18108
TOTALS 11 362629
12 351676
-10953

MLC - April 19, 2012

ADULT JUVENILE JUVENILE

YEAR MONTH
35509 1803
33330 1396
-2179 -407
7506 550
6761 357
-745 -193
25655 859
25820 1065
165 206
17347 412
14856 644
-2491 232
8692 389
6590 253
-2102 -136
91968 6339
94115 6191
2147 -148
16901 0
18188 0
1287 0
55260 0
73368 0
18108 o
38330 0
195033 0
156703 o
3158459 153552
3179744 154262
21285 710

MLS - March 2012 Circulation Gains & Losses

TOTAL TOTAL

YEAR MONTH YEAR
15636 5567 51145
13857 4800 47187
-1779 -767 -3958
4290 1463 11796
3476 890 10237
-814 -573 -1559
8999 3180 34654
11066 3926 36886
2067 746 2232
4296 2448 21643
4445 2392 19301
149 -56 -2342
2942 1276 11634
2637 964 9227
-305 -312 -2407
57012 16581 148980
56692 16717 150807
-320 136 1827
0 2104 16901

0 2204 18188

0 100 1287

0 7465 55260

0 8601 73368

o 1136 18108

0 9067 38330

0 27175 195033

o 18108 156703
1361882 516181 4520341
1407532 505938 4587276
45650 -10243 66935

%

-13.2

6.4

-10.8

-20.7

1.2

7.6

32.8

408.8

1.5
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Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12

April 19, 2012
Total Computer Hours Used by Library
July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)
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BELLE ISLE

BETHANY

CAPITOL HILL

CHOCTAW

DEL CITY

DOWNTOWN

EDMOND

MIDWEST CITY

RALPH ELLISON

FY

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

MLC - April 19, 2012
MLS - March 2012 Computer Usage by All Customers

Month
Customers
266

219

-47

213
196
-17

180
229
49

108
71

185
170
-15

218
203
-15

239
240

366
329

255
245
-10

%

-17.7

27.2

-34.3

-10.1

Total Computer Usage

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

Month
Visits
4,741
4,128
-613

3,351
3,075
-276

3,191
3,545
354

1,870
1,438
-432

2,916
2,877
-39

10,288
8,945
-1,343

4,279
4,160
-119

5,909
6,239
330

5,334
5,242
92

%

-12.9

11.1

-23.1

-1.3

-13.1

5.6

-1.7

Month
Hours Used
3,610.81
3,362.25
-248.56

2,733.40
2,547.79
-185.61

2,623.08
2,948.54
325.46

1,788.88
1,618.59
-170.29

2,637.70
2,608.37
-29.33

7,585.23
8,372.83
787.60

3,673.86
4,057.05
383.19

5,329.73
5,315.07
-14.66

4,739.98
4,667.99
-71.99

%

-6.9

-6.8

12.4

-1.1

10.4

10.4

-1.5

Year
Customers
3,638
3,634

-4

2,856
3,053
197

2,657
3,237
580

1,479
1,492
13

2,646
2,651
5

3,474
3,339
-135

3,622
3,857
235

5,227
5,331
104

3,420
4,000
580

Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

Year Year

% Visits % Hours Used %
38,633 29,489.00
38,087 29,909.99

-1 -546 -1.4 420.99 1.4
28,904 22,746.95
28,869 22,810.88

6.9 -35 -1 63.93 .3
27,568 22,044.24
31,817 25,637.14

21.8 4,249 15.4 3,592.90 16.3
16,083 15,378.69
14,732 15,599.99

.9 -1,351 -8.4 221.30 1.4
26,833 22,843.66
30,997 24,556.19

2 4,164 15.5 1,712.53 7.5
98,368 76,349.70
88,004 71,822.33

-3.9 -10,364 -10.5 -4,527.37 -5.9
35,941 30,290.80
38,123 34,864.85

6.5 2,182 6.1 4,574.05 15.1
54,629 46,417.73
58,999 47,976.41

2.0 4,370 8.0 1,558.68 3.4
49,859 41,103.98
52,501 42,211.57

17.0 2,642 5.3 1,107.59 2.7
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SOUTHERN OAKS

VILLAGE

WARR ACRES

HARRAH

JONES

LUTHER

NICOMA PARK

WRIGHT

TOTAL

MLC - April 19, 2012

FY

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

Month
Customers

406
300
-106

279
272
-7

279
219

27
18
-9

2
20

15

-5

14

15

17
-12
3,077

2,749
-328

%

-26.1

-21.5

-33.3

-40.0

-25.0

7.1

-70.6

-10.7

Total Computer Usage

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

Month
Visits

6,020
5,397
-623

4,252
4,400
148

4,216
4,198
.18

635
443
-192

57
41
-16

493
388
-105

207
181

258
251
-7

58,017
54,948
-3,069

MLS - March 2012 Computer Usage by All Customers

%

-10.3

3.5

-4

-30.2

-28.1

-21.3

Month
Hours Used

4,863.36
4,662.26
-201.10

3,547.87
3,648.14
100.27

3,495.97
3,351.97
-144.00

510.27
385.49
-124.78

59.81
38.91
-20.90

402.39
368.43
-33.96

193.34
151.80
-41.54

202.25
206.83
4.58

47,997.93
48,312.31
314.38

%

2.8

-24.5

-34.9

-21.5

2.3

Year
Customers

5,347
4,587
760

3,955
4,229
274

3,375
3,407
32

434
421
-13

55
56

487
408
-79

167
155
-12

159
201
42

42,998
44,058
1,060

%

-14.2

6.9

-3.0

1.8

-16.2

26.4

2.5

Year
Visits

51,661
50,194
-1,467

37,755
38,456
701

38,290
39,428
1,138

5,148
4,456
-692

507
533
26

4,608
4,303
-305

1,760
1,517
-243

2,098
2,195
97

518,645
523,211
4,566

%

-2.8

1.9

3.0

-13.4

5.1

-6.6

-13.8

4.6

.9

Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

Year
Hours Used %

40,372.73
41,104.25
731.52 1.8

29,962.76
31,203.89
1,241.13 4.1

29,923.97
30,426.38
502.41 1.7

4,287.05
3,813.48
-473.57 -11.0

437.37
517.03
79.66 18.2

3,733.17
4,153.96
420.79 11.3

1,634.03
1,387.22
-246.81 -15.1

1,753.42
1,718.14
-35.28  -2.0

418,769.25
429,713.70
10,944.45 2.6

Prepared by: Information Technology
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BELLE ISLE

BETHANY

CAPITOL HILL

CHOCTAW

DEL CITY

DOWNTOWN

EDMOND

MIDWEST CITY

RALPH ELLISON

FY

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

11
12

MLC - April 19, 2012

MLS - March 2012 Computer Usage by Adult Customers

Computer Usage by Adult Customers

Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

Month
Customers
218

193

-25

165
159
-6

131
137

83
58

154
131

197
188

201
200
-1

286
264

208
180

%

-11.5

4.6

-30.1

-14.9

-13.5

Month
Visits
4,197
3,699
-498

2,702
2,615
-87

1,579
1,947
368

1,273
1,003
270

2,354
2,366
12

9,915
8,553
-1,362

3,679
3,598
-81

4,595
4,647
52

3,622
3,553
-69

%

-11.9

23.3

-21.2

-13.7

1.1

-1.9

Month
Hours Used
3,204.68
3,029.19
-175.49

2,231.35
2,173.71
-57.64

1,474.74
1,714.87
240.13

1,168.02
1,064.21
-103.81

2,122.70
2,158.38
35.68

7,288.40
7,984.04
695.64

3,134.81
3,456.05
321.24

4,225.31
4,077.25
-148.06

3,405.78
3,121.23
-284.55

%

16.3

1.7

9.5

10.2

-3.5

-8.4

Year
Customers
3,056
3,072

16

2,309
2,502
193

1,629
1,990
361

1,088
1,088

2,092
2,090
-2

3,014
2,949
-65

3,031
3,246
215

4,163
4,252
89

2,603
2,970
367

%

8.4

22.2

7.1

2.1

14.1

Year Year
Visits % Hours Used %
33,023 25,308.08
33,485 26,423.35
462 1.4 1,115.27 4.4
23,526 18,574.05
23,503 18,636.90
-23 -1 62.85 .3
13,350 11,847.73
16,647 14,497.05
3,297 24.7 2,649.32 22.4
11,123 10,535.89
10,335 10,405.29
-788 -7.1 -130.60 -1.2
21,197 18,077.57
25,086 20,069.30
3,889 18.3 1,991.73 11.0
93,139 72,145.76
84,231 68,637.78
-8,908 -9.6 -3,507.98 -4.9
30,680 25,751.70
32,438 29,570.80
1,758 5.7 3,819.10 14.8
40,846 35,413.77
44,021 36,562.95
3,175 7.8 1,149.18 3.2
30,963 27,293.10
34,141 28,797.84
3,178 10.3 1,504.74 5.5
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Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

Computer Usage by Adult Customers

July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

Month Month Month Year Year Year

FY Customers % Visits % Hours Used % Customers % Visits % Hours Used %
SOUTHERN OAKS 11 323 4,249 3,482.83 4,039 35,828 28,520.47
12 221 3,679 3,258.46 3,411 35,070 29,451.14

-102 -31.6 -570 -13.4 -224.37 -6.4 -628 -15.5 -758 -2.1 930.67 3.3
VILLAGE 11 221 3,305 2,778.58 3,162 28,855 23,165.44
12 214 3,431 2,793.42 3,401 28,907 23,540.94

-7 -3.2 126 3.8 14.84 .5 239 7.6 52 2 375.50 1.6
WARR ACRES 11 225 3,666 3,024.67 2,818 32,106 24,921.68
12 186 3,414 2,675.09 2,844 32,149 24,638.43

-39 -17.3 -252 -6.9 -349.58 -11.6 26 .9 43 .1 -283.25 -1.1
HARRAH 11 17 431 343.97 295 3,441 2,835.23
12 15 301 230.45 298 2,820 2,188.82

-2 -11.8 -130 -30.2 -113.52 -33.0 3 1.0 -621 -18.0 -646.41 -22.8
JONES 11 5 52 57.02 38 413 373.42
12 1 32 30.14 37 469 473.56

-4  -80.0 -20 -38.5 -26.88 -47.1 -1 -2.6 56 13.6 100.14 26.8
LUTHER 11 18 268 226.66 265 2,271 1,883.31
12 8 267 253.95 235 2,549 2,453.88

-10 -55.6 -1 -4 27.29 12.0 -30 -11.3 278 12.2 570.57 30.3
NICOMA PARK 11 13 160 164.98 124 1,429 1,396.71
12 12 161 132.57 123 1,335 1,244.20

-1 -7.7 1 .6 -32.41 -19.6 -1 -.8 -94 -6.6 -152.51 -10.9
WRIGHT 11 15 225 178.59 118 1,703 1,474.77
12 5 200 162.68 151 1,567 1,281.60

-10 -66.7 -25  -11.1 -15.91 -8.9 33 28.0 -136 -8.0 -193.17 -13.1
TOTAL 11 2,480 46,272 38,513.09 33,844 403,893 329,518.68
12 2,172 43,466 38,315.69 34,659 408,753 338,873.83

-308 -12.4 -2,806 -6.1 -197.40 -5 815 2.4 4,860 1.2 9,355.15 2.8

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Information Technology
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Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

Computer Usage by Minor Customers
July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

Month Month Month Year Year Year

FY Customers % Visits % Hours Used % Customers % Visits % Hours Used %
BELLE ISLE 11 48 544 406.13 582 5,610 4,180.92
12 26 429 333.06 562 4,602 3,486.64

-22 -45.8 -115 -21.1 -73.07 -18.0 -20 -3.4 -1,008 -18.0 -694.28 -16.6
BETHANY 11 48 649 502.05 547 5,378 4,172.90
12 37 460 374.08 551 5,366 4,173.98

-11 -22.9 -189 -29.1 -127.97 -25.5 4 7 -12 -2 1.08 .0
CAPITOL HILL 11 49 1,612 1,148.34 1,028 14,218 10,196.51
12 92 1,598 1,233.67 1,247 15,170 11,140.09

43 87.8 -14 -9 85.33 7.4 219 21.3 952 6.7 943.58 9.3
CHOCTAW 11 25 597 620.86 391 4,960 4,842.80
12 13 435 554.38 404 4,397 5,194.70

-12  -48.0 -162  -27.1 -66.48 -10.7 13 3.3 -563 -11.4 351.90 7.3
DEL CITY 11 31 562 515.00 554 5,636 4,766.09
12 39 511 449.99 561 5,911 4,486.89

8 25.8 -51 -9.1 -65.01 -12.6 7 1.3 275 4.9 -279.20 -5.9
DOWNTOWN 11 21 373 296.83 460 5,229 4,203.94
12 15 392 388.79 390 3,773 3,184.55

-6 -28.6 19 5.1 91.96 31.0 -70 -15.2 -1,456 -27.8 -1,019.39 -24.2
EDMOND 11 38 600 539.05 591 5,261 4,539.10
12 40 562 601.00 611 5,685 5,294.05

2 5.3 -38 -6.3 61.95 11.5 20 3.4 424 8.1 754.95 16.6
MIDWEST CITY 11 80 1,314 1,104.42 1,064 13,783 11,003.96
12 65 1,592 1,237.82 1,079 14,978 11,413.46

-15 -18.8 278 21.2 133.40 12.1 15 1.4 1,195 8.7 409.50 3.7
RALPH ELLISON 11 47 1,712 1,334.20 817 18,896 13,810.88
12 65 1,689 1,546.76 1,030 18,360 13,413.73

18 38.3 -23 -1.3 212.56 15.9 213 26.1 -536 -2.8 -397.15 -2.9

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Information Technology
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Document # 97
MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

Computer Usage by Minor Customers
July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

Month Month Month Year Year Year

FY Customers % Visits % Hours Used % Customers % Visits % Hours Used %
SOUTHERN OAKS 11 83 1,771 1,380.53 1,308 15,833 11,852.26
12 79 1,718 1,403.80 1,176 15,124 11,653.11

-4 -4.8 -53 -3.0 23.27 1.7 -132 -10.1 -709 -4.5 -199.15 -1.7
VILLAGE 11 58 947 769.29 793 8,900 6,797.32
12 58 969 854.72 828 9,549 7,662.95

.0 22 2.3 85.43 11.1 35 4.4 649 7.3 865.63 12.7
WARR ACRES 11 54 550 471.30 557 6,184 5,002.29
12 33 784 676.88 563 7,279 5,787.95

-21  -38.9 234 42.5 205.58 43.6 6 1.1 1,095 17.7 785.66 15.7
HARRAH 11 10 204 166.30 139 1,707 1,451.82
12 3 142 155.04 123 1,636 1,624.66

-7 -70.0 -62 -30.4 -11.26 -6.8 -16 -11.5 -71 -4.2 172.84 11.9
JONES 11 5 2.79 17 94 63.95
12 2 9 8.77 19 64 43.47

2 4 80.0 598 214.3 2 11.8 -30 -31.9 -20.48 -32.0
LUTHER 11 2 225 175.73 222 2,337 1,849.86
12 7 121 114.48 173 1,754 1,700.08

5 250.0 -104 -46.2 -61.25 -34.9 -49 -22.1 -583 -24.9 -149.78 -8.1
NICOMA PARK 11 1 47 28.36 43 331 237.32
12 3 20 19.23 32 182 143.02

2 200.0 -27 -57.4 -9.13 -32.2 -11 -25.6 -149 -45.0 -94.30 -39.7
WRIGHT 11 2 33 23.66 41 395 278.65
12 51 44.15 50 628 436.54

-2 -100.0 18 54.5 20.49 86.6 9 22.0 233 59.0 157.89 56.7
TOTAL 11 597 11,745 9,484.84 9,154 114,752 89,250.57
12 577 11,482 9,996.62 9,399 114,458 90,839.87

-20 -3.4 -263 -2.2 511.78 54 245 2.7 -294 -.3 1,589.30 1.8

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Information Technology
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Document # 98
MLC FY 2011-12

April 19, 2012
System Reserve Report
July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)
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MLC FY 2011-12
April 19, 2012

System Reserve Report
July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012 (75.00% of the 11-12 Fiscal Year)

System Reserve History Chart
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System Reserves Report
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Year
Placed
94,364
81,588

-12,776

58,249
57,417
-832

10,298
10,785
487

21,937
20,669
-1,268

35,005
35,173
168

173,993
161,350
-12,643

39,213
38,191
-1,022

66,243
60,891
-5,352

11,966
12,958
992

75,700
63,283
-12,417

81,216
77,991
-3,225

71,607
70,036
-1,571

%

-13.5

-1.4

4.7

-5.8

-7.3

-2.6

-8.1

8.3

-16.4

-4.0

-2.2

Month Year
Filled Filled %
10,048 89,654
7,916 77,716
-2,132 -11,938 -13.3
6,298 56,277
5,717 54,375
-581 -1,902 -3.4
1,157 9,848
1,016 10,470
-141 622 6.3
2,413 21,146
1,754 19,823
-659 -1,323 -6.3
3,738 33,552
3,076 31,847
-662 -1,705 -5.1
18,714 168,069
16,059 155,929
-2,655 -12,140 -7.2
4,361 37,292
3,718 36,727
-643 -565 -1.5
7,376 63,680
6,154 59,008
-1,222 -4,672 -7.3
1,147 11,545
1,390 12,455
243 910 7.9
5,926 71,478
6,657 60,764
731 -10,714 -15.0
9,081 78,073
7,488 75,182
-1,593 -2,891 -3.7
7,709 69,177
6,870 67,754
-839 -1,423 -2.1
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Month Year Month Year

Placed Placed % Filled Filled %
HARRAH 11 1,242 11,147 1,193 10,770
12 885 8,533 846 8,220

-357 -2,614 -23.5 -347 -2,550 -23.7
JONES 11 443 3,261 391 3,149
12 303 3,397 283 3,369

-140 136 4.2 -108 220 7.0
LUTHER 11 916 9,215 900 8,856
12 966 9,139 914 8,941

50 -76 -.8 14 85 1.0
NICOMA PARK 11 717 5,684 667 5,507
12 736 4,940 604 4,647

19 -744 -13.1 -63 -860 -15.6
WRIGHT 11 252 2,463 261 2,409
12 301 2,562 285 2,499

49 99 4.0 24 90 3.7
BOOKS-BY-MAIL 11 921 7,650 869 7,384
12 726 7,298 740 7,144

-195 -352 -4.6 -129 -240 -3.3
TOTAL 11 86,712 779,211 82,249 747,866
12 76,756 726,205 71,487 696,872

-9,956 -53,006 -6.8 -10,762 -50,994 -6.8
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Executive Director's Report
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EXFOUTIVE DIRFGTOR’S REPORT
AprrIL 2012

Primary Book Vendor Ewvaluation

The Metropolitan Library System’s policy SF200 Purchasing calls for an annual service evaluation of the primary
book vendor and for an initiation of the competitive bid process if the current vendor fails to meet the library’s
needs. Karen Marriott, Deputy Executive Director/ Materials & Outreach, has completed the evaluation for the
period July 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012.

The evaluation shows that Baker & Taylor has met or exceeded requirements of the current contract. Highlights of
the evaluation as of March 31 include:

The evaluation shows that Baker & Taylor has met or exceeded requirements of the current contract. Highlights of
the evaluation as of March 31 include:
e Discounts received are 1.56% higher than estimates
o Afill rate of 9o.2% with many orders still out ( the contract calls for a 9go% fill rate). Last year’s final fill rate
came in at 98.9%.
e Problems with receipt of materials has been low — 97.7% of invoices and 99.8% of materials have been
received without problems.
e Customer service response has been excellent with 100% of requests for assistance handled satisfactorily.
Because of the above, Baker & Taylor continues to be the best option for us at this time and our current contract will
remain in force due to their excellent performance.

Legislative Efforts

The Oklahoma Library Association held its annual legislative day this week on April 11. A number of staff members
will be participating as part of the association’s efforts to bring awareness to the Oklahoma legislature about library
issues.

| will again be participating in National Library Legislative Day in Washington DC on April 23 and 24", This year we
have a small delegation representing Tulsa, Oklahoma City, Clinton and Norman. Federal funding is critical in the
Oklahoma Department of Libraries efforts that support summer reading and databases throughout the entire state.

Policy and Procedure HouseKeeping

According to our Purchasing policy SF200; Section VI #19, the library may contract with employees or other
associated individuals (such as family members) for special services including artistic endeavors or books that the
library might want to purchase for its collection. In these cases, The Executive Director will make a disclosure to the
Commission at its regular monthly meeting whenever one of these specific situations occurs. | have 2 of these
situations to report to the commission.

e We recently purchased copies of the book IMPACT: Blacks in Oklahoma History written by the spouse of an
employee.

e Midwest City Library will be using relatives of employees for several programs in the upcoming months; a
knitting program; a coupon program and a children’s craft program.

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Executive Director
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Literary Voices Event

Congratulations to our very own Hugh Rice who was honored Tuesday night (April 10) with the Lee B. Brawner
award at the annual Literary Voices dinner. Hugh spoke eloquently about the library and its mission and our role in
the community.

The dinner was once again a great success with tables filled to capacity. The featured speaker Mary Higgins Clark
charmed the audience with her stories about her life as a wife, mother and author. Larry Nichols was an outstanding
master of ceremonies and a good time was had by all.

Capital Projects Updafte

As | write this; the Northwest library is close to substantial completion and the grand opening date of May 22, 2012
at 3:30is getting closer. Yesterday, | visited Northwest and many activities were underway. Our IT staff was
working with the vendor to install the 7 bin sorter which will be one of NW unique features, data cabling was
occurring in the building and various trades were working on completing the punch listitems. Itis a spectacular
building and one that will work well for us, we believe. Customers are highly anticipating the opening and are
anxious to begin using the new library. We are currently working on the invitations and mailing list and you all will
receive them in early May. We have music and activities and refreshments planned immediately after the ribbon
cutting, so it promises to be a festive evening.

| also had the opportunity to visit Southern Oaks Library this week and the construction remains on schedule and
going well. Our Metropolitan Library System “M” logo has been placed on the beautiful new red exterior facade as
well as a large Southern Oaks Library sign on the entrway and they both look very nice. The new driveway is
complete and the interior finishes are underway. We are on schedule to reopen in late August in the newly
renovated building.

DIRFECTOR OUTREACH ACTIVITIES

Attend Rotary 29 Club Meetings

OLA Legislative Meeting

Tour Northwest Library Site

Literary Voices Author Dinner

Endowment Trust Breakfast for Literary Voices Guest Author
OLA Legislative Day @State Capital

Oklahoma City Arts

Public Libraries Association Conference in Philadelphia

FUTURE LIBRARY EVENTS OF SPECIAI NOTE

Zumba

Saturday, May 5, 2012

Time: 1:00pm-2:00pm

Location: Ralph Ellison

Adults

Looking for a fun way to get in shape? Have you always wanted to try Zumba? Then let instructor Candace
Liger show you the moves each Saturday in May at the Ralph Ellison Library.

O T T I I T T

I Gan’t Believe I Shot That - V..Strikes Back!
Sunday, May 6, 2012

MLC - April 19, 2012 Prepared by: Executive Director
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Time: 2:00pm-4:00pm

Location: Downtown

All Ages

It's the 5th Annual Downtown Library's "I Can't Believe | Shot That!" Teen film festival!l The top films
submitted will be screened for the public and prizes will be given out for 1st, 2nd & 3rd place, there will also
be an Audience Choice prize! Refreshments will be served, so if you're attending please register at (405)
606-3879.

Getting All There Is From your eReader

Tuesday, May 8, 2012

Time: 6:00pm-7:00pm

Location: Choctaw

Adults

Kindles of every ilk, Nooks of every nature. iPods, iPads and I-don’t-knows. Bring your eReader and get
clear, written, step-by-step instructions on how to check books out from the Metropolitan Library System.
While we’ll concentrate on books from MLS, we'll also have time for sharing information such as sites for
free and inexpensive books, care and feeding of your eReader, and other relevant issues.

Heartland Voices Sing Out for Mother’s Day Fvent

Saturday, May 12, 2012

Time: 2:00pm-3:00pm

Location: Bethany

Bethany Library is pleased to host the "Heartland Voices". This community women's vocal music chorus will
perform at the Art's Festival this year. This is a free event for all ages. Mothers will receive a special gift.
Refreshments will be served after the program. Seating is limited so please come early. Doors will close at
2pm.

Carmen T. Bernier-Grand Author wvisit

Monday, May 14, 2012

Time: 9:30am-10:30am

Location: Capitol Hill

All Ages

Carmen T. Bernier-Grand is a three time Pura Belpre honor winner for writing. Originally from Puerto Rico,
she writes stories and poetry for children about her childhood, about important Latino cultural figures and
collections of folktales from her country. Carmen will talk about her country, her books and about becoming
a children's author. Cosponsor: Friends of the Metropolitan Library System.

Asian-Pacific American Heritage Month Program

Saturday, May 19, 2012

Time: 2:00pm

Location: Belle Isle

All Ages

May is Asian-Pacific American Heritage Month. This program with Tao Ling, will present a fun and interesting
program for all ages exploring Chinese culture. The program will feature learning a few Chinese words, a Tai Chi
Quan demonstration (including audience participation), a performance of Tai Chi Fan dance, and a demonstration of
calligraphy with audience participation.

Al Bostick Story Teller
Wednesday, May 23, 2012

Time: 3:30pm-5:30pm

Location: Northwest
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All Ages

Master Story Teller, griot, and Renaissance man, Al Bostick will present a performance that will delight, teach and

stimulate your mind, body and spirit. Cosponsor: Library Endowment Trust and Friends of the Metropolitan Library
System.
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